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Using the Across and Down clues, write the correct words in the numbered grid below.

ACROSS

1. The �rst person to use a telescope to 
study the stars.

4. A bowl-shaped depression formed by 
the impact of a meteoroid.

7. The distance traveled by light in a year.
8. A large cloud of dust and gas which 

escapes from the nucleus of an active 
comet.

9. It is the brightest object in the sky except 
for the Sun and the Moon.

10. Named after the Roman god of the 
sea.

DOWN

2. Classi�ed into di�erent types: elliptic, 
spiral and barred-spiral. Ours is the Milky 
Way.

3. The closest planet to the Sun and the 
eighth largest.

5. The only planet whose English name 
does not derive from Greek/Roman 
mythology.

6. A small body that circles the Sun with a 
highly elliptical orbit.
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Solar system
Using the Across and Down clues, write the correct words in the numbered grid below.

ACROSS

1. The first person to use a telescope to 
study the stars.

4. A bowl-shaped depression formed by 
the impact of a meteoroid.

7. The distance traveled by light in a year.

8. A large cloud of dust and gas which 
escapes from the nucleus of an active 
comet.

9. It is the brightest object in the sky except 
for the Sun and the Moon.

10. Named after the Roman god of the 
sea.

DOWN

2. Classified into different types: elliptic, 
spiral and barred-spiral. Ours is the Milky 
Way.

3. The closest planet to the Sun and the 
eighth largest.

5. The only planet whose English name 
does not derive from Greek/Roman 
mythology.

6. A small body that circles the Sun with a 
highly elliptical orbit.
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